

NOTICE OF AWARD
COUNTY OF BERGEN
ADMINISTRATION & FINANCE, DIVISION OF PURCHASING
REGISTERED COOPERATIVE PRICING SYSTEM #11-BeCCP
REGISTERED BERGEN COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM #CK04
ONE BERGEN COUNTY PLAZA, HACKENSACK, N.J. 07601

Service/Commodity:	Repair Services for Large Scale Motorized Vehicles, Equipment & Diesel Engines
Bergen County Bid #:	16-04.2
Contract Period:	May 18, 2016 through March 21, 2017
Board of Chosen Freeholders Resolution:	# 546-16, dated May 18, 2016

PRICES:

Unit prices quoted shall be firm unless otherwise stated herein, net exclusive of all taxes and must include all transportation, delivery and unloading costs, fully prepaid FOB destination, inside delivery debris removed.

AVAILABILITY OF COUNTY CONTRACT PRICES AND AGREEMENT:

The County Supplier agrees to make his products and county contract prices available to all Local Government Jurisdictions (Municipalities, Authorities and Public School Districts et al) which are enrolled in the County's Registered Cooperative Programs. Each Local Government deciding to take advantage of the subject prices shall itself be directly responsible for having drawn up and executed whatever Contractual Instrument it deems necessary for governing business relations between itself and the supplier.

DELIVERY ARRANGEMENTS, PLACEMENT OF ORDERS AND UNAPPROVED SUBSTITUTES:

All deliveries are to be made within the time period stated on the "Price Information Sheet". If the delivery time is not stated on the "Price Information Sheet" then delivery shall be ten (10) days of the receipt of order. Vendor must accept written Purchase Orders or authorized verbal request from authorized Personnel. Emergency deliveries are to be made within twenty-four (24) hours of receipt of a telephone request from Authorized Personnel. Participants are authorized to accept only those items covered by County Contract. Compliance with this requirement is a joint responsibility of the participant and the vendor.



Gerald T. Reiner, Jr., CCPO, QPA
Purchasing Agent
201-336-7111

VENDOR INFORMATION

In order to assure that all future correspondence is directed to the correct address, assure proper ordering, expedite future payments, and in accord with I.R.S. regulations, the following information must be provided with this bid.

Name of Business: Foley Incorporated

Correspondence Address (including zip code):

855 Centennial Avenue
Piscataway, NJ 08855

Purchase Order Address (including zip code):

855 Centennial Avenue
Piscataway, NJ 08855

Payment Address (including zip code):

Foley Incorporated
PO Box 787132
Philadelphia, PA 19178-7132

Telephone Number (including area code): (~~732~~ 885-5555

Email Address: dschuermann@foleyinc.com

Fax Number (including area code): (~~732~~ 457-0551

Employer I.D. # or S.S. #: 22-0917100

FAILURE TO PROVIDE ALL OF THE ABOVE INFORMATION MAY RESULT IN REJECTION OF THIS BID.

11. ADDITIONAL BIDDER INFORMATION REQUIRED

To assist the County of Bergen in determining the responsibility of the bidder, each Bidder shall furnish the following information, and may furnish any additional information believed to be pertinent

- (1) Number of Years in Heavy-Construction Equipment Repair Work: 59 years
- (2) Shop Equipment (Fair Appraisal Value) \$ 10 Million
- (3) Storage Space (sq.ft.): Inside 186,316 Outside 26.33 Acres
- (4) Total Personnel regularly employed on Full-Time Basis 350
 - Supervisory Mechanics 50
 - Mechanics 65
 - Mechanic Helpers 30
 - Welders 5

(5) Comparable Governmental Agencies in New Jersey serviced within the past 5 years, giving Name thereof, together with Makes, Types and Weight Classes of Equipment serviced:

- County of Middlesex, Caterpillar Machinery, Paving Equipment
- County of Union, Caterpillar Machinery, Heavy Equipment
- County of Morris, Caterpillar Machinery, Heavy Equipment
- County of Warren, Caterpillar Machinery, Heavy Equipment
- County of Sussex, Caterpillar Machinery, Heavy Equipment

- 12. "All mechanics working on Federal Administration (FTA) funded systems must be in a FTA approved Drug and Alcohol Testing program.
- 13. The County of Bergen reserves the right to add or delete any items from this bid.

VENDOR INFORMATION

In order to assure that all future correspondence is directed to the correct address, assure proper ordering, expedite future payments, and in accord with I.R.S. regulations, the following information must be provided with this bid.

Name of Business: HUDSON COUNTY MOTORS, INC.

Correspondence Address (including zip code):

PO BOX 2611
SECAUCUS NJ 07096-2611

Purchase Order Address (including zip code):

PO BOX 2611
SECAUCUS NJ 07096-2611

Payment Address (including zip code):

PO BOX 2611
SECAUCUS NJ 07096-2611

Telephone Number (including area code): (201) 866-5570

Email Address: SSavietta@hudsoncountymotors.com

Fax Number (including area code): (201) 866-5757

Employer I.D. # or S.S. #: 22-142-1211

FAILURE TO PROVIDE ALL OF THE ABOVE INFORMATION MAY RESULT IN REJECTION OF THIS BID.

11. ADDITIONAL BIDDER INFORMATION REQUIRED

To assist the County of Bergen in determining the responsibility of the bidder, each Bidder shall furnish the following information, and may furnish any additional information believed to be pertinent

- (1) Number of Years in Heavy-Construction Equipment Repair Work: 71 YEARS
- (2) Shop Equipment (Fair Appraisal Value) \$ 600,000
- (3) Storage Space (sq. ft.): Inside 10,000 Outside 5 ACRES
- (4) Total Personnel regularly employed on Full-Time Basis 52

Supervisory Mechanics 1

Mechanics 10

Mechanic Helpers 1

Welders 2

(5) Comparable Governmental Agencies in New Jersey serviced within the past 5 years, giving Name thereof, together with Makes, Types and Weight Classes of Equipment serviced:

- WALDVIK TOWNSHIP - WESTERN STAR PULL-OFF, 44,000 LB - 70,000 GVW
- LIVINGSTON TOWNSHIP - WESTERN STAR DUMP, 44,000 LB - 70,000 LB GVW
- NORTH BERGEN TOWNSHIP - VOLVO REFUSE, 70,000 LB GVW
- PARAMUS BOROUGHS - ANTI-CAP SIDELOADER, 66,000 LB GVW
- SUMMIT CITY - VOLVO TRACTOR, 80,000 GVW

- 12. "All mechanics working on Federal Administration (FTA) funded systems must be in a FTA approved Drug and Alcohol Testing program.
- 13. The County of Bergen reserves the right to add or delete any items from this bid.

****FIRST RENEWAL OPTION**

Bidder shall here state the single, firm (i.e., fixed) flat-rate Total Billable Hourly Haulage Rate:

\$ 315.00 /hour

The hourly rate shall be carried out to two decimal places (\$00.00).

It shall apply to all of the subject equipment which the Bidder may be required to transport, from time to time, during first-shift or straight time working hours on normal business days (Monday through Friday) of each work week.

Bidder here states that this hourly rate shall prevail for equipment haulage services which may be required of him during other than straight-time working hours on normal business days.

YES NO

****SECOND RENEWAL OPTION**

Bidder shall here state the single, firm (i.e., fixed) flat-rate Total Billable Hourly Haulage Rate:

\$ 330.00 /hour

The hourly rate shall be carried out to two decimal places (\$00.00).

It shall apply to all of the subject equipment which the Bidder may be required to transport, from time to time, during first-shift or straight time working hours on normal business days (Monday through Friday) of each work week.

Bidder here states that this hourly rate shall prevail for equipment haulage services which may be required of him during other than straight-time working hours on normal business days.

YES NO

7. **METHOD OF OPERATION**

7.1 An authorized representative of the Using County Agency having a piece of equipment needing repair and covered by this advertised bid proposal shall, so notify the Contractor's Service Manager by telephone.

7.2 If the contractor represents the only equipment repair facility holding a contract with the County of Bergen applicable to the subject piece of equipment needing repair the bidder shall then make an on-site field inspection of the equipment, together with an authorized representative of the Using County agency, and, if necessary shall transport said equipment

5.4 ACCEPTABLE REPLACEMENT PARTS, SUB-ASSEMBLIES AND ASSEMBLIES

Bidder shall use new and unused replacement parts, sub-assemblies and assemblies produced by the original manufacturer or the machinery requiring repair, i.e., he shall use so-called OEM parts.

The County of Bergen reserves the right to reject bidder's proposal if, in the opinion of the County of Bergen, the use of other than new, unused and standardized OEM replacement parts, sub-assemblies or assemblies, could possibly jeopardize either (1) overall equipment reliability or (2) overall equipment efficiency (i.e., unit cost of operation), or (3) overall equipment effectiveness (i.e., performance capability), or (4) any combination thereof.

5.5 EXCHANGE COMPONENTS

Bidder may use exchange components provided that said components represents rebuilt sub-assemblies or assemblies (1) conforming to specifications of the original manufacturer thereof: and (2) using for replacement material only OEM parts, sub assemblies or assemblies.

5.6 REPLACEMENT PARTS, SUB-ASSEMBLIES, ASSEMBLIES AND EXCHANGE COMPONENTS TO BE USED.

Bidder shall here fully identify all major make(s) and source of supply of new and unused replacement parts, sub-assemblies, assemblies and exchange components that he will use in the performance of the subject equipment repair work. The parts supplies must be listed for OEM and also other than OEM.

6. EQUIPMENT HAULAGE SERVICE

Bidder shall be responsible for picking up equipment needing repair, from any job site within Bergen County (N.J.), when and as required: and for transporting it safely to the repair shop. The bidder is also responsible for transporting subject repaired equipment safely back to any job site within Bergen County designated by the Using County agency.

6.1 TOTAL BILLABLE HOURLY HAULAGE RATE

Bidder shall here state the single, firm (i.e., fixed) flat-rate Total Billable Hourly Haulage Rate:

\$ 300.00 /hour

The hourly rate shall be carried out to two decimal places (\$00.00).

It shall apply to all of the subject equipment which the Bidder may be required to transport, from time to time, during first-shift or straight time working hours on normal business days (Monday through Friday) of each work week.

Bidder here states that this hourly rate shall prevail for equipment haulage services which may be required of him during other than straight-time working hours on normal business days.

X YES _____ NO

VENDOR INFORMATION

In order to assure that all future correspondence is directed to the correct address, assure proper ordering, expedite future payments, and in accord with I.R.S. regulations, the following information must be provided with this bid.

Name of Business: Groff Tractor New Jersey LLC

Correspondence Address (including zip code):

551 N. Harding Hwy., Vineland, NJ 08360

Purchase Order Address (including zip code):

551 N. Harding Hwy., Vineland, NJ 08360

Payment Address (including zip code):

551 N. Harding Hwy., Vineland, NJ 08360

Telephone Number (including area code): (856) 697-1414

Email Address: karenforte@grofftractor.com

Fax Number (including area code): (856) 697-4842

Employer I.D. # or S.S. #: 47-3910479

FAILURE TO PROVIDE ALL OF THE ABOVE INFORMATION MAY RESULT IN REJECTION OF THIS BID.

11. ADDITIONAL BIDDER INFORMATION REQUIRED

To assist the County of Bergen in determining the responsibility of the bidder, each Bidder shall furnish the following information, and may furnish any additional information believed to be pertinent

- (1) Number of Years in Heavy-Construction Equipment Repair
Work: 10 month under Groff Tractor
60+ years under Trico
- (2) Shop Equipment (Fair Appraisal Value) \$ 300,000.00
- (3) Storage Space (sq. ft.): Inside 8,000 Outside 2 Acres
- (4) Total Personnel regularly employed on Full-Time Basis 11
- Supervisory Mechanics 1
- Mechanics 5
- Mechanic Helpers 0
- Welders 1

(5) Comparable Governmental Agencies in New Jersey serviced within the past 5 years, giving Name thereof, together with Makes, Types and Weight Classes of Equipment serviced: Serviced under Groff Tractor within the last 10 months

Passaic County- Case 621B 28,000 lbs, 621F 28,000 lbs.

Westwood Case 621E 28,000 lbs.

Maywood - Case 580SN 1bs.

Essex County - 621B 28,000 lbs

Hillsdale - Case 621F 28,000 lbs.

12. "All mechanics working on Federal Administration (FTA) funded systems must be in a FTA approved Drug and Alcohol Testing program.
13. The County of Bergen reserves the right to add or delete any items from this bid.

VENDOR INFORMATION

In order to assure that all future correspondence is directed to the correct address, assure proper ordering, expedite future payments, and in accord with I.R.S. regulations, the following information must be provided with this bid.

Name of Business: On-Site Fleet Service, Inc

Correspondence Address (including zip code):

25 Borough St
Rutherford, NJ 07070

Purchase Order Address (including zip code):

36 Edgeboro Rd
East Brunswick, NJ 07865

Payment Address (including zip code):

36 Edgeboro Rd
East Brunswick NJ

Telephone Number (including area code): (24) 438-6900

Email Address: Mattonsite@aol.com

Fax Number (including area code): (732) 651-6300

Employer I.D. # or S.S. #: 222-211-336

FAILURE TO PROVIDE ALL OF THE ABOVE INFORMATION MAY RESULT IN REJECTION OF THIS BID.

5.4 ACCEPTABLE REPLACEMENT PARTS, SUB-ASSEMBLIES AND ASSEMBLIES

Bidder shall use new and unused replacement parts, sub-assemblies and assemblies produced by the original manufacturer or the machinery requiring repair, i.e., he shall use so-called OEM parts.

The County of Bergen reserves the right to reject bidder's proposal if, in the opinion of the County of Bergen, the use of other than new, unused and standardized OEM replacement parts, sub-assemblies or assemblies, could possibly jeopardize either (1) overall equipment reliability or (2) overall equipment efficiency (i.e., unit cost of operation), or (3) overall equipment effectiveness (i.e., performance capability), or (4) any combination thereof.

5.5 EXCHANGE COMPONENTS

Bidder may use exchange components provided that said components represents rebuilt sub-assemblies or assemblies (1) conforming to specifications of the original manufacturer thereof: and (2) using for replacement material only OEM parts, sub assemblies or assemblies.

5.6 REPLACEMENT PARTS, SUB-ASSEMBLIES, ASSEMBLIES AND EXCHANGE COMPONENTS TO BE USED.

Bidder shall here fully identify all major make(s) and source of supply of new and unused replacement parts, sub-assemblies, assemblies and exchange components that he will use in the performance of the subject equipment repair work. The parts supplies must be listed for OEM and also other than OEM.

6. EQUIPMENT HAULAGE SERVICE

Bidder shall be responsible for picking up equipment needing repair, from any job site within Bergen County (N.J.), when and as required: and for transporting it safely to the repair shop. The bidder is also responsible for transporting subject repaired equipment safely back to any job site within Bergen County designated by the Using County agency.

6.1 TOTAL BILLABLE HOURLY HAULAGE RATE

Bidder shall here state the single, firm (i.e., fixed) flat-rate Total Billable Hourly Haulage Rate:

\$ 125.⁰⁰ /hour

The hourly rate shall be carried out to two decimal places (\$00.00).

It shall apply to all of the subject equipment which the Bidder may be required to transport, from time to time, during first-shift or straight time working hours on normal business days (Monday through Friday) of each work week.

Bidder here states that this hourly rate shall prevail for equipment haulage services which may be required of him during other than straight-time working hours on normal business days.

X YES _____ NO

****FIRST RENEWAL OPTION**

Bidder shall here state the single, firm (i.e., fixed) flat-rate Total Billable Hourly Haulage Rate:

\$ 125.⁰⁰ /hour

The hourly rate shall be carried out to two decimal places (\$00.00).

It shall apply to all of the subject equipment which the Bidder may be required to transport, from time to time, during first-shift or straight time working hours on normal business days (Monday through Friday) of each work week.

Bidder here states that this hourly rate shall prevail for equipment haulage services which may be required of him during other than straight-time working hours on normal business days.

X YES _____ NO

****SECOND RENEWAL OPTION**

Bidder shall here state the single, firm (i.e., fixed) flat-rate Total Billable Hourly Haulage Rate:

\$ 125.⁰⁰ /hour

The hourly rate shall be carried out to two decimal places (\$00.00).

It shall apply to all of the subject equipment which the Bidder may be required to transport, from time to time, during first-shift or straight time working hours on normal business days (Monday through Friday) of each work week.

Bidder here states that this hourly rate shall prevail for equipment haulage services which may be required of him during other than straight-time working hours on normal business days.

X YES _____ NO

7. **METHOD OF OPERATION**

7.1 An authorized representative of the Using County Agency having a piece of equipment needing repair and covered by this advertised bid proposal shall, so notify the Contractor's Service Manager by telephone.

7.2 If the contractor represents the only equipment repair facility holding a contract with the County of Bergen applicable to the subject piece of equipment needing repair the bidder shall then make an on-site field inspection of the equipment, together with an authorized representative of the Using County agency, and, if necessary shall transport said equipment

11. ADDITIONAL BIDDER INFORMATION REQUIRED

To assist the County of Bergen in determining the responsibility of the bidder, each Bidder shall furnish the following information, and may furnish any additional information believed to be pertinent

- (1) Number of Years in Heavy-Construction Equipment Repair Work: 38
- (2) Shop Equipment (Fair Appraisal Value) \$ 2,50,000
- (3) Storage Space (sq. ft.): Inside 4800 Outside 1/2 Acre
- (4) Total Personnel regularly employed on Full-Time Basis _____
- Supervisory Mechanics 3
- Mechanics 10
- Mechanic Helpers 0
- Welders 5

(5) Comparable Governmental Agencies in New Jersey serviced within the past 5 years, giving Name thereof, together with Makes, Types and Weight Classes of Equipment serviced:

Bergen County Special Services - Bluebird Bus 31,350 GVW

US Post Office - Mack CH613 80,000 GVW

Leonia BOE - Thomas Bus 26,000 GVW

Hackensack, City of - IHC/NAVISTAR 55,000 GVW

Woodland Park DPW - IHC, 80,000 GVW

12. "All mechanics working on Federal Administration (FTA) funded systems must be in a FTA approved Drug and Alcohol Testing program.
13. The County of Bergen reserves the right to add or delete any items from this bid.

VENDOR INFORMATION

In order to assure that all future correspondence is directed to the correct address, assure proper ordering, expedite future payments, and in accord with I.R.S. regulations, the following information must be provided with this bid.

Name of Business: JESCO. INC.

Correspondence Address (including zip code):

118 ST. NICHOLAS AVENUE

SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080

Purchase Order Address (including zip code):

1260 CENTENNIAL AVENUE

PISCATAWAY, NJ 08854

Payment Address (including zip code):

1260 CENTENNIAL AVENUE

PISCATAWAY, NJ 08854

Telephone Number (including area code): (908) 753-8080

Email Address: JONR@JESCO.US

Fax Number (including area code): (908) 753-7853

Employer I.D. # or S.S. #: 22-1979549

FAILURE TO PROVIDE ALL OF THE ABOVE INFORMATION MAY RESULT IN REJECTION OF THIS BID.

5.4 ACCEPTABLE REPLACEMENT PARTS, SUB-ASSEMBLIES AND ASSEMBLIES

Bidder shall use new and unused replacement parts, sub-assemblies and assemblies produced by the original manufacturer or the machinery requiring repair, i.e., he shall use so-called OEM parts.

The County of Bergen reserves the right to reject bidder's proposal if, in the opinion of the County of Bergen, the use of other than new, unused and standardized OEM replacement parts, sub-assemblies or assemblies, could possibly jeopardize either (1) overall equipment reliability or (2) overall equipment efficiency (i.e., unit cost of operation), or (3) overall equipment effectiveness (i.e., performance capability), or (4) any combination thereof.

5.5 EXCHANGE COMPONENTS

Bidder may use exchange components provided that said components represents rebuilt sub-assemblies or assemblies (1) conforming to specifications of the original manufacturer thereof: and (2) using for replacement material only OEM parts, sub assemblies or assemblies.

5.6 REPLACEMENT PARTS, SUB-ASSEMBLIES, ASSEMBLIES AND EXCHANGE COMPONENTS TO BE USED.

Bidder shall here fully identify all major make(s) and source of supply of new and unused replacement parts, sub-assemblies, assemblies and exchange components that he will use in the performance of the subject equipment repair work. The parts supplies must be listed for OEM and also other than OEM.

6. EQUIPMENT HAULAGE SERVICE

Bidder shall be responsible for picking up equipment needing repair, from any job site within Bergen County (N.J.), when and as required: and for transporting it safely to the repair shop. The bidder is also responsible for transporting subject repaired equipment safely back to any job site within Bergen County designated by the Using County agency.

6.1 TOTAL BILLABLE HOURLY HAULAGE RATE

Bidder shall here state the single, firm (i.e., fixed) flat-rate Total Billable Hourly Haulage Rate:

\$ 160.00 /hour

The hourly rate shall be carried out to two decimal places (\$00.00).

It shall apply to all of the subject equipment which the Bidder may be required to transport, from time to time, during first-shift or straight time working hours on normal business days (Monday through Friday) of each work week.

Bidder here states that this hourly rate shall prevail for equipment haulage services which may be required of him during other than straight-time working hours on normal business days.

X YES _____ NO

****FIRST RENEWAL OPTION**

Bidder shall here state the single, firm (i.e., fixed) flat-rate Total Billable Hourly Haulage Rate:

\$ 170.00 /hour

The hourly rate shall be carried out to two decimal places (\$00.00).

It shall apply to all of the subject equipment which the Bidder may be required to transport, from time to time, during first-shift or straight time working hours on normal business days (Monday through Friday) of each work week.

Bidder here states that this hourly rate shall prevail for equipment haulage services which may be required of him during other than straight-time working hours on normal business days.

X YES NO

****SECOND RENEWAL OPTION**

Bidder shall here state the single, firm (i.e., fixed) flat-rate Total Billable Hourly Haulage Rate:

\$ 180.00 /hour

The hourly rate shall be carried out to two decimal places (\$00.00).

It shall apply to all of the subject equipment which the Bidder may be required to transport, from time to time, during first-shift or straight time working hours on normal business days (Monday through Friday) of each work week.

Bidder here states that this hourly rate shall prevail for equipment haulage services which may be required of him during other than straight-time working hours on normal business days.

X YES NO

7. METHOD OF OPERATION

7.1 An authorized representative of the Using County Agency having a piece of equipment needing repair and covered by this advertised bid proposal shall, so notify the Contractor's Service Manager by telephone.

7.2 If the contractor represents the only equipment repair facility holding a contract with the County of Bergen applicable to the subject piece of equipment needing repair the bidder shall then make an on-site field inspection of the equipment, together with an authorized representative of the Using County agency, and, if necessary shall transport said equipment

11. ADDITIONAL BIDDER INFORMATION REQUIRED

To assist the County of Bergen in determining the responsibility of the bidder, each Bidder shall furnish the following information, and may furnish any additional information believed to be pertinent

- (1) Number of Years in Heavy-Construction Equipment Repair Work: 43
- (2) Shop Equipment (Fair Appraisal Value) \$ 500,000.00
- (3) Storage Space (sq. ft.): Inside 8,000 Outside 200,000
- (4) Total Personnel regularly employed on Full-Time Basis 35

Supervisory Mechanics 4

Mechanics 20

Mechanic Helpers 3

Welders 8

(5) Comparable Governmental Agencies in New Jersey serviced within the past 5 years, giving Name thereof, together with Makes, Types and Weight Classes of Equipment serviced:

COUNTY OF UNION - JOHN DEERE 310SK BACKHOE LOADER - 14,708 LBS
COUNTY OF MONMOUTH - JOHN DEERE 850K CRAWLER DOZER - 48,548 LBS
TOWNSHIP OF FRANKLIN - JOHN DEERE 544J 4WD LOADER - 27,489 LBS
TOWNSHIP OF MIDDLETOWN - JOHN DEERE 624H 4WD LOADER - 30,492 LBS
TOWNSHIP OF LIVINGSTON - JOHN DEERE 724J 4WD LOADER - 40,704 LBS

- 12. "All mechanics working on Federal Administration (FTA) funded systems must be in a FTA approved Drug and Alcohol Testing program.
- 13. The County of Bergen reserves the right to add or delete any items from this bid.

VENDOR INFORMATION

In order to assure that all future correspondence is directed to the correct address, assure proper ordering, expedite future payments, and in accord with I.R.S. regulations, the following information must be provided with this bid.

Name of Business: GABRIELLI of New Jersey

Correspondence Address (including zip code):

239 Bergen Tpke
Ridgefield Park NJ 07660

Purchase Order Address (including zip code):

239 Bergen Tpke
Ridgefield Park NJ 07660

Payment Address (including zip code):

2306 RT 130 North
Dayton NJ 08810

Telephone Number (including area code): (201) 641-4440

Email Address: gdefilippi@gabriellitruck.com

Fax Number (including area code): (732) 438-0739

Employer I.D. # or S.S. #: 120-52-0443

FAILURE TO PROVIDE ALL OF THE ABOVE INFORMATION MAY RESULT IN REJECTION OF THIS BID.

5.4 ACCEPTABLE REPLACEMENT PARTS, SUB-ASSEMBLIES AND ASSEMBLIES

Bidder shall use new and unused replacement parts, sub-assemblies and assemblies produced by the original manufacturer or the machinery requiring repair, i.e., he shall use so-called OEM parts.

The County of Bergen reserves the right to reject bidder's proposal if, in the opinion of the County of Bergen, the use of other than new, unused and standardized OEM replacement parts, sub-assemblies or assemblies, could possibly jeopardize either (1) overall equipment reliability or (2) overall equipment efficiency (i.e., unit cost of operation), or (3) overall equipment effectiveness (i.e., performance capability), or (4) any combination thereof.

5.5 EXCHANGE COMPONENTS

Bidder may use exchange components provided that said components represents rebuilt sub-assemblies or assemblies (1) conforming to specifications of the original manufacturer thereof; and (2) using for replacement material only OEM parts, sub assemblies or assemblies.

5.6 REPLACEMENT PARTS, SUB-ASSEMBLIES, ASSEMBLIES AND EXCHANGE COMPONENTS TO BE USED.

Bidder shall here fully identify all major make(s) and source of supply of new and unused replacement parts, sub-assemblies, assemblies and exchange components that he will use in the performance of the subject equipment repair work. The parts supplies must be listed for OEM and also other than OEM.

6. EQUIPMENT HAULAGE SERVICE

Bidder shall be responsible for picking up equipment needing repair, from any job site within Bergen County (N.J.), when and as required; and for transporting it safely to the repair shop. The bidder is also responsible for transporting subject repaired equipment safely back to any job site within Bergen County designated by the Using County agency.

6.1 TOTAL BILLABLE HOURLY HAULAGE RATE

Bidder shall here state the single, firm (i.e., fixed) flat-rate Total Billable Hourly Haulage Rate:

\$ 135⁰⁰ /hour

The hourly rate shall be carried out to two decimal places (\$00.00).

It shall apply to all of the subject equipment which the Bidder may be required to transport, from time to time, during first-shift or straight time working hours on normal business days (Monday through Friday) of each work week.

Bidder here states that this hourly rate shall prevail for equipment haulage services which may be required of him during other than straight-time working hours on normal business days.

_____ YES

_____ NO

****FIRST RENEWAL OPTION**

Bidder shall here state the single, firm (i.e., fixed) flat-rate Total Billable Hourly Haulage Rate:

\$ 140⁰⁰ /hour

The hourly rate shall be carried out to two decimal places (\$00.00).

It shall apply to all of the subject equipment which the Bidder may be required to transport, from time to time, during first-shift or straight time working hours on normal business days (Monday through Friday) of each work week.

Bidder here states that this hourly rate shall prevail for equipment haulage services which may be required of him during other than straight-time working hours on normal business days.

_____ YES _____ NO

****SECOND RENEWAL OPTION**

Bidder shall here state the single, firm (i.e., fixed) flat-rate Total Billable Hourly Haulage Rate:

\$ 145⁰⁰ /hour

The hourly rate shall be carried out to two decimal places (\$00.00).

It shall apply to all of the subject equipment which the Bidder may be required to transport, from time to time, during first-shift or straight time working hours on normal business days (Monday through Friday) of each work week.

Bidder here states that this hourly rate shall prevail for equipment haulage services which may be required of him during other than straight-time working hours on normal business days.

_____ YES _____ NO

7. **METHOD OF OPERATION**

7.1 An authorized representative of the Using County Agency having a piece of equipment needing repair and covered by this advertised bid proposal shall, so notify the Contractor's Service Manager by telephone.

7.2 If the contractor represents the only equipment repair facility holding a contract with the County of Bergen applicable to the subject piece of equipment needing repair the bidder shall then make an on-site field inspection of the equipment, together with an authorized representative of the Using County agency, and, if necessary shall transport said equipment

11. ADDITIONAL BIDDER INFORMATION REQUIRED

To assist the County of Bergen in determining the responsibility of the bidder, each Bidder shall furnish the following information, and may furnish any additional information believed to be pertinent

- (1) Number of Years in Heavy-Construction Equipment Repair Work: 35 YEARS
- (2) Shop Equipment (Fair Appraisal Value) \$ 250,00⁰⁰
- (3) Storage Space (sq. ft.): Inside _____ Outside ✓
- (4) Total Personnel regularly employed on Full-Time Basis 20
 - Supervisory Mechanics 4
 - Mechanics 13
 - Mechanic Helpers 2
 - Welders 1

(5) Comparable Governmental Agencies in New Jersey serviced within the past 5 years, giving Name thereof, together with Makes, Types and Weight Classes of Equipment serviced:

- 12. "All mechanics working on Federal Administration (FTA) funded systems must be in a FTA approved Drug and Alcohol Testing program.
- 13. The County of Bergen reserves the right to add or delete any items from this bid.

VENDOR INFORMATION

In order to assure that all future correspondence is directed to the correct address, assure proper ordering, expedite future payments, and in accord with I.R.S. regulations, the following information must be provided with this bid.

Name of Business: BEYER BROS. CORP.

Correspondence Address (including zip code):

109 BROAD AVENUE
FAIRVIEW, NJ 07022

Purchase Order Address (including zip code):

109 BROAD AVENUE
FAIRVIEW, NJ 07022

Payment Address (including zip code):

109 BROAD AVENUE
FAIRVIEW, NJ 07022

Telephone Number (including area code): (201) 943-3100

Email Address: E.BEYER@BEYERBROS.COM

Fax Number (including area code): (201) 943-8192

Employer I.D. # or S.S. #: 22-1852116

FAILURE TO PROVIDE ALL OF THE ABOVE INFORMATION MAY RESULT IN REJECTION OF THIS BID.

11. ADDITIONAL BIDDER INFORMATION REQUIRED

To assist the County of Bergen in determining the responsibility of the bidder, each Bidder shall furnish the following information, and may furnish any additional information believed to be pertinent

- (1) Number of Years in Heavy-Construction Equipment Repair Work: 50
- (2) Shop Equipment (Fair Appraisal Value) \$ 495,000.00
- (3) Storage Space (sq. ft.): Inside 43,000 Outside 7 ACRES
- (4) Total Personnel regularly employed on Full-Time Basis 65
- Supervisory Mechanics 2
- Mechanics 10
- Mechanic Helpers 2
- Welders 2

(5) Comparable Governmental Agencies in New Jersey serviced within the past 5 years, giving Name thereof, together with Makes, Types and Weight Classes of Equipment serviced: **PLEASE, SEE ATTACHED REFERENCE SHEETS.**

12. "All mechanics working on Federal Administration (FTA) funded systems must be in a FTA approved Drug and Alcohol Testing program.
13. The County of Bergen reserves the right to add or delete any items from this bid.

****FIRST RENEWAL OPTION**

Bidder shall here state the single, firm (i.e., fixed) flat-rate Total Billable Hourly Haulage Rate:

\$ 160.00 /hour

The hourly rate shall be carried out to two decimal places (\$00.00).

It shall apply to all of the subject equipment which the Bidder may be required to transport, from time to time, during first-shift or straight time working hours on normal business days (Monday through Friday) of each work week.

Bidder here states that this hourly rate shall prevail for equipment haulage services which may be required of him during other than straight-time working hours on normal business days.

YES NO

****SECOND RENEWAL OPTION**

Bidder shall here state the single, firm (i.e., fixed) flat-rate Total Billable Hourly Haulage Rate:

\$ 165.00 /hour

The hourly rate shall be carried out to two decimal places (\$00.00).

It shall apply to all of the subject equipment which the Bidder may be required to transport, from time to time, during first-shift or straight time working hours on normal business days (Monday through Friday) of each work week.

Bidder here states that this hourly rate shall prevail for equipment haulage services which may be required of him during other than straight-time working hours on normal business days.

YES NO

7. **METHOD OF OPERATION**

7.1 An authorized representative of the Using County Agency having a piece of equipment needing repair and covered by this advertised bid proposal shall, so notify the Contractor's Service Manager by telephone.

7.2 If the contractor represents the only equipment repair facility holding a contract with the County of Bergen applicable to the subject piece of equipment needing repair the bidder shall then make an on-site field inspection of the equipment, together with an authorized representative of the Using County agency, and, if necessary shall transport said equipment

5.4 ACCEPTABLE REPLACEMENT PARTS, SUB-ASSEMBLIES AND ASSEMBLIES

Bidder shall use new and unused replacement parts, sub-assemblies and assemblies produced by the original manufacturer or the machinery requiring repair, i.e., he shall use so-called OEM parts.

The County of Bergen reserves the right to reject bidder's proposal if, in the opinion of the County of Bergen, the use of other than new, unused and standardized OEM replacement parts, sub-assemblies or assemblies, could possibly jeopardize either (1) overall equipment reliability or (2) overall equipment efficiency (i.e., unit cost of operation), or (3) overall equipment effectiveness (i.e., performance capability), or (4) any combination thereof.

5.5 EXCHANGE COMPONENTS

Bidder may use exchange components provided that said components represents rebuilt sub-assemblies or assemblies (1) conforming to specifications of the original manufacturer thereof: and (2) using for replacement material only OEM parts, sub assemblies or assemblies.

5.6 REPLACEMENT PARTS, SUB-ASSEMBLIES, ASSEMBLIES AND EXCHANGE COMPONENTS TO BE USED.

Bidder shall here fully identify all major make(s) and source of supply of new and unused replacement parts, sub-assemblies, assemblies and exchange components that he will use in the performance of the subject equipment repair work. The parts supplies must be listed for OEM and also other than OEM.

6. EQUIPMENT HAULAGE SERVICE

Bidder shall be responsible for picking up equipment needing repair, from any job site within Bergen County (N.J.), when and as required: and for transporting it safely to the repair shop. The bidder is also responsible for transporting subject repaired equipment safely back to any job site within Bergen County designated by the Using County agency.

6.1 TOTAL BILLABLE HOURLY HAULAGE RATE

Bidder shall here state the single, firm (i.e., fixed) flat-rate Total Billable Hourly Haulage Rate:

\$ 155.00 /hour

The hourly rate shall be carried out to two decimal places (\$00.00).

It shall apply to all of the subject equipment which the Bidder may be required to transport, from time to time, during first-shift or straight time working hours on normal business days (Monday through Friday) of each work week.

Bidder here states that this hourly rate shall prevail for equipment haulage services which may be required of him during other than straight-time working hours on normal business days.

X YES _____ NO

SCHEDULE

Bergen County Bid #

Resolution

16-04.2

COOPERATIVE

As per N.J.S.A. 40A:11-11

Provide Repair Services for Large Scale Motorized, Vehicles, Equipment and Diesel Engines as required by the County of Bergen, various using Agencies

Cooperative Pricing Systems:

#CK04-Bergen

#11BECCP

Contracted Period

May 18, 2016 through March 21, 2017
Initial Contract period

A. COOPERATIVE AWARD: Unit Pricing and Discounts

Multiple Vendors of Award

** For sections with multi-vendor awards: Primary vendor will be determined at the time service is needed and based on rate/equipment/availability.*

* Foley, Inc.
855 Centennial Ave
Piscataway NJ, 08855

Repair Labor, Haulage & Parts Schedules:
"G 1-3", "AD 1-2",
Rates attached

* Groff Tractor New Jersey LLC
551 N. Harding Highway
Vineland, NJ 08360

Repair Labor, Haulage & Parts Schedules:
"C1", "D1", "L1" "AD3"
Rates attached

* Hudson County Motors, Inc.
614 New County Rd
PO Box 2611
Secaucus, NJ 07096

Repair Labor, Haulage & Parts Schedules:
"B1-5", "AE1-3", "AJ1", "AK1-3",
Rates attached

* Jesco, Inc.
1260 Centennial Ave 118 St. Nicholas Ave
Piscataway, NJ 08854 South Plainfield, NJ 07080

Repair Labor, Haulage & Parts Schedules:
"H1-5"
Rates attached

* On-Site Fleet Services, Inc.
25 Borough St
Rutherford, NJ 07070

Repair Labor, Haulage & Parts Schedules:
"B1-5", "E1", "F1-3", "H1-1-61" "M1-4", "M6-13", "N1", "AE1-3",
"AF1-3", "AH1-10", "AJ1", "AK1-3", "AO1", "AP1-2", "AQ1",
"AR1-2", "AS1-2", "AT1-3", "AY1-3", "AZ1"
Rates attached

* Beyer Bros. Corp.
109 Broad Avenue
Fairview, NJ 07022

Repair Labor, Haulage & Parts Schedules:
"B1-5", "E1", "F1-3", "J1", "M1-4", "M6-13", "N1", "AE1-3",
"AF1-3", "AH1-10", "AJ1", "AK1-3", "AM1", "AO1", "AP1-2",
"AQ1", "AR1-2", "AS1-2", "AT1-3", "AU1", "AV1", "AY1-3", "AZ1"
Rates attached

* Gabrielli Kenworth of NJ LLC
2300 Route 130
North Dayton, NJ 08810

Repair Labor, Haulage & Parts Schedules:
"E1", "AD3", "AQ1",
Rates attached

B. AWARD: Lead Agency

Open Ended Award

*The monetary award for the Open Ended
and resolved under the Initial Bid: 16-04 Resolution# 292-16 03/22/16

C: No bids were received for the following schedules for the second time:

County will acquire open market on an as needed basis.

"A", "K", "O", "P", "Q", "R", "S", "T", "U", "V", "W", "X", "Y", "Z", "AA", "AB", "AC", "AG", "AL", "AW", "AX",

MANUFACTURER:		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-A"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-B"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-C"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-D"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-E"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-F"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-G"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-H"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-I"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-J"	
ITEM NO	MODEL YEAR OF MFG	EQUIP DESCRIPTION	MFG SERIAL NUMBER	B.C.I.D. NO.	APPROX G.V.W. (LBS)	AGENCY AND AGENCY LEAD	AGENCY ADDRESS AND PHONE NO.	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE:	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)
1	2000	Model 218 Chipper	12014	29407	7200	Asst Supervisor of Road: Russell Martin	70 Zabriskie St Hackensack, NJ 201-446-2811	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

MANUFACTURER:		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-B"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-C"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-D"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-E"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-F"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-G"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-H"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-I"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-J"		
ITEM NO	MODEL YEAR OF MFG	EQUIP DESCRIPTION	MFG SERIAL NUMBER	B.C.I.D. NO.	APPROX G.V.W. (LBS)	AGENCY AND AGENCY LEAD	AGENCY ADDRESS AND PHONE NO.	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE:	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	
1		Quote Standard Rate						NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

MANUFACTURER:		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-C"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-D"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-E"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-F"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-G"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-H"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-I"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-J"		
ITEM NO	MODEL YEAR OF MFG	EQUIP DESCRIPTION	MFG SERIAL NUMBER	B.C.I.D. NO.	APPROX G.V.W. (LBS)	AGENCY AND AGENCY LEAD	AGENCY ADDRESS AND PHONE NO.	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE:	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	
1	2005	Kayval Coach	1FDX35R651A17702	43220	14000	President's Office Lost Cohns	10 Main Street Hackensack, NJ 201-446-2500	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

MANUFACTURER:		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-D"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-E"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-F"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-G"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-H"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-I"		EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-J"	
ITEM NO	MODEL YEAR OF MFG	EQUIP DESCRIPTION	MFG SERIAL NUMBER	B.C.I.D. NO.	APPROX G.V.W. (LBS)	AGENCY AND AGENCY LEAD	AGENCY ADDRESS AND PHONE NO.	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE:	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM)
1	1999	Chapin / DYC	4K300521	17183	15000	Mosquito Control Peter Puchino	Jerome Ave Paramus, NJ 201-434-2883	\$168.00	\$168.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2	1987	Chapin / Bulldozer	8RC902	17188	15000	Mosquito Control Peter Puchino	Jerome Ave Paramus, NJ 201-434-2884	\$168.00	\$168.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3	2002	Case Wheel Loader	JEB013761	29421	15000	Asst Supervisor of Road: Russell Martin	70 Zabriskie St Hackensack, NJ 201-446-2811	NO BID	NO BID	\$98.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM NO	MANUFACTURER : MODEL YEAR OF MFG	EQUIP DESCRIPTION	EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE "A-Z"	ECLD NO1	APPROX G.V.W. (LBS)	AGENCY AND AGENCY LEAD	AGENCY ADDRESS AND PHONE NO.	FOLEY, INC.		GROFF TRACTOR		HUDSON COUNTY MOTORS		IESCO, INC.		ON-SITE FLEET SERVICES, INC.		BEVER BROS. CORP		GABRIELLI TRUCK SALES		
								STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON WELDING LABOR)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON WELDING LABOR)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON WELDING LABOR)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON WELDING LABOR)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON WELDING LABOR)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC (NON WELDING LABOR)	STRAIGHT-TIME HOURLY LABOR RATE: WELDING (IF DIFFERENT FROM MECHANICAL & HYDRAULIC)		
1	2012	THOMAS/TRANSIT LINER	TR88DE2XC1147310	45-112	35,350	Hamstead Security James Hamstead	Jerome Ave Paterson, NJ 201-451-2893	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Section 5: Parts Discount

0% Discount	\$168.00	0% Discount	25% Mfg Parts	2% Discount	20% Discount	25% Discount	28% Discount
Straight	Overtime	0% Discount	15% Cummins Parts	\$160.00 Flat	\$125.00 Flat	\$155.00 Flat	\$135.00 / Hour

Section 6.1 Haulage Rate

0% Discount	\$168.00	0% Discount	25% Mfg Parts	2% Discount	20% Discount	25% Discount	28% Discount
Straight	Overtime	0% Discount	15% Cummins Parts	\$160.00 Flat	\$125.00 Flat	\$155.00 Flat	\$135.00 / Hour